

Exhibit A: Digesting Time

	Date	Timekeeper	Journal Entry	Allocated Hours	Aggregate Hours
4642	08/21/14	JL	Telephone conference with Smith re: case scheduling with Larry Schoolcraft (.75); draft response to medical defendants re: depositions of Dr. Patel and Dr. Lwin and City Defendants re: discovery issues (1.25); complete Adrian Schoolcraft 2nd deposition summary (2.50).	2.50	4.50
2488	9/16/2014	JLL	Ferrara summary deposition	2.00	2.00
2489	9/17/2014	JLL	Ferrara summary deposition.	2.00	2.00
2490	9/23/2014	JLL	Ferrara summary deposition	8.00	8.00
2491	9/24/2014	JLL	Ferrara and Broschart summary deposition.	8.00	8.00
2492	9/25/2014	JLL	Broschart summary deposition	8.00	8.00
2493	9/30/2014	JS	Reading, taking notes and discussing the Schoolcraft depositions	5.50	5.50
2494	9/30/2014	JS	Reading, taking notes and discussing the Schoolcraft depositions.	5.50	5.50
2497	10/2/2014	JS	Reading and taking notes on Schoolcraft Depositions; listening to and discussing Schoolcraft tapes from October 31, 2009.	2.22	4.43
2498	10/2/2014	JS	Reading and taking notes on the Schoolcraft depositions; listening to and discussing the Schoolcraft tapes from October 31, 2009.	2.50	5.00
2499	10/3/2014	ls	Trainor summary deposition.	5.00	5.00
2500	10/6/2014	JS	Reading, taking notes, and discussing the Schoolcraft depositions.	1.00	1.00
2501	10/7/2014	JS	Reading and taking notes and discussing the Schoolcraft depositions.	2.50	2.50
2503	10/8/2014	JLL	Mauriello deposition summary - session 2 with errata sheet.	3.00	3.00
2502	10/8/2014	LS	Trainor summary deposition	5.00	5.00
2506	10/8/2014	LS	Trainor summary deposition.	5.00	5.00

	Date	Timekeeper	Journal Entry	Allocated Hours	Aggregate Hours
2509	10/9/2014	LS	Trainor summary deposition.	2.00	2.00
2507	10/9/2014	JLL	Drafting deposition summary - session 2 with errata sheet.	2.00	2.00
2505	10/9/2014	JS	Reading, taking notes, and discussing the Schoolcraft depositions	1.75	1.75
2504	10/9/2014	JS	Reading, taking notes and discussing the Schoolcraft depositions.	2.00	2.00
2508	10/10/2014	JS	Reading, taking notes and discussing the Schoolcraft depositions	1.00	1.00
2510	10/14/2014	JS	Reading and taking notes.	3.00	3.00
2511	10/14/2014	JS	Reading and taking notes on the Schoolcraft depositions.	3.00	3.00
2512	10/15/2014	JS	Reading and discussing the Schoolcraft depositions.	2.00	2.00
2513	10/16/2014	JLL	Mauriello deposition summary - session 2 with errata sheet.	8.00	8.00
2514	10/17/2014	JLL	Mauriello deposition summary - session 2 with errata sheet.	4.00	4.00
2515	10/19/2014	JLL	Shantel James deposition summary.	3.00	3.00
2516	10/20/2014	JLL	Shantel James deposition summary.	2.00	2.00
2517	10/21/2014	LS	Gough deposition summary.	4.00	4.00
2519	10/21/2014	LS	Gough deposition summary.	4.00	4.00
2518	10/22/2014	JLL	Kurt Duncan deposition summary.	5.00	5.00
2520	10/23/2014	JLL	Kurt Duncan deposition summary.	3.00	3.00
2522	10/24/2014	LS	Sawyer deposition summary	4.00	4.00
2523	10/27/2014	LS	Sawyer deposition summary.	4.00	4.00
2524	10/28/2014	LS	Sawyer deposition summary.	4.00	4.00
2526	10/30/2014	LS	Sawyer deposition summary.	3.00	3.00
2527	10/31/2014	LS	Gough deposition summary	4.00	4.00
2528	11/3/2014	LS	Summarize Gough deposition transcript.	3.00	3.00
2529	11/7/2014	LS	Summarize Marquez deposition transcript.	4.50	4.50
2530	11/10/2014	LS	Summarize Marquez deposition transcript.	4.50	4.50
2531	11/12/2014	LS	Summarize Marquez deposition transcript.	5.00	5.00
2532	11/13/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Sangetti.	4.00	4.00

	Date	Timekeeper	Journal Entry	Allocated Hours	Aggregate Hours
2533	11/14/2014	LS	Summarized deposition of Larry Schoolcraft.	2.00	2.00
2534	11/14/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Sangetti	4.00	4.00
2535	11/16/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Sangetti	2.00	2.00
2536	11/17/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Sangetti	4.00	4.00
4691	11/18/14	JL	Review of legal assistant's work in summarizing deposition transcripts.	1.00	1.00
2537	11/20/2014	JLL	Summarized deposition of Larry Schoolcraft.	5.00	5.00
2538	11/23/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Larry Schoolcraft.	5.00	5.00
2541	11/24/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Dr. Patel.	3.00	3.00
2539	11/24/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Dr. Patel	4.00	4.00
2540	11/25/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Larry Schoolcraft.	5.00	5.00
2542	11/26/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Larry Schoolcraft.	5.00	5.00
2544	11/28/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Steven Mauriello.	2.00	2.00
2543	11/28/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Purpi	3.50	3.50
2547	11/28/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Purpi.	3.50	3.50
2545	11/29/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition Steven Mauriello	1.00	1.00
2546	11/30/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Steven Mauriello.	2.00	2.00
2550	12/1/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Steven Mauriello,	4.00	4.00
2548	12/1/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Dr. Patel	2.00	2.00
2549	12/1/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Purpi.	1.00	1.00
2551	12/2/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Steven Mauriello.	6.00	6.00
2552	12/4/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Steven Mauriello.	4.00	4.00
2553	12/5/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Dr. Lwin.	3.00	3.00
1854	02/05/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Bernier; digested same	1.90	1.90
2555	12/6/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Dr. Lwin.	1.00	1.00
2558	12/9/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Dominick Valenti.	1.00	1.00

	Date	Timekeeper	Journal Entry	Allocated Hours	Aggregate Hours
2559	12/10/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Carrasco.	4.00	4.00
2560	12/10/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Dominick Valenti	8.00	8.00
2562	12/11/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Kevin Finnegan.	3.00	3.00
2563	12/12/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Kevin Finnegan.	3.00	3.00
2564	12/13/2014	JLL	Summarize deposition of Bernard Whalen.	2.50	2.50
2565	12/15/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Cooper.	3.00	3.00
2566	12/16/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Cooper	4.00	4.00
2567	12/17/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Cooper.	3.00	3.00
2568	12/18/2014	LS	Summarize deposition of Cooper	2.00	2.00
2579	1/3/2015	LS	Summarize Lauterborn deposition.	3.00	3.00
2581	1/5/2015	LS	Summarize Lauterborn deposition.	3.00	3.00
2582	1/7/2015	LS	Summarize Marino deposition transcript.	3.00	3.00
2583	1/8/2015	LS	Summarize Marino deposition transcript.	3.00	3.00
2584	1/9/2015	LS	Summarize Marino deposition transcript.	2.00	2.00
1851	01/29/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Mauriello; digested same	2.40	2.40
2589	1/29/2015	LS	Silverman deposition summary for expert witness.	5.00	5.00
2591	1/30/2015	LS	Silverman deposition summary for expert witness.	4.00	4.00
1061	02/01/15	JLN	Read Curtis Boston Dep.; notes on same	0.60	0.60
1062	02/01/15	JLN	Read Rasheena Huffman Dep.; took notes re: same	0.50	0.50
2592	2/2/2015	LS	Silverman deposition summary for expert witness.	4.00	4.00
2594	2/2/2015	LS	Silverman deposition summary for expert witness.	5.00	5.00
1067	02/04/15	JLN	Reviewed 1st 112 of Mauriello's dep; took notes re: same	1.70	1.70
2595	2/4/2015	LS	Silverman deposition summary for expert witness.	2.00	2.00
2598	2/5/2015	LS	Summarized Adrian Schoolcraft deposition transcript.	4.00	4.00
1855	02/06/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of	1.30	1.30

	Date	Timekeeper	Journal Entry	Allocated Hours	Aggregate Hours
			Cooper; digested same		
2599	2/6/2015	LS	Summarize Adrian Schoolcraft deposition transcript.	4.00	4.00
1856	02/09/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Finnegan; digested same	1.10	1.10
2600	2/9/2015	LS	Summarize Adrian Schoolcraft deposition transcript.	4.00	4.00
2601	2/10/2015	LS	Summarize Adrian Schoolcraft deposition transcript.	4.00	4.00
2602	2/10/2015	JLL	Summary of Whittman deposition transcript.	1.00	1.00
1857	02/11/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Caughey; digested same	1.70	1.70
2604	2/11/2015	LS	Summarize Adrian Schoolcraft deposition transcript.	4.00	4.00
2603	2/11/2015	JLL	Summarize Whittman deposition transcript.	2.00	2.00
1858	02/12/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Duncan; digested same	0.60	0.60
2605	2/12/2015	LS	Summarize Adrian Schoolcraft deposition transcript.	4.00	4.00
2606	2/13/2015	LS	Summarize Adrian Schoolcraft deposition transcript.	4.00	4.00
2608	2/16/2015	JLL	Summarize Milone deposition transcript.	1.50	1.50
2607	2/16/2015	LS	Summarize Adrian Schoolcraft deposition transcript.	3.00	3.00
2609	2/17/2015	JLL	Summarize Milone deposition transcript.	3.50	3.50
1134	02/22/15	JLN	Read and highlighted transcript of Lt. Joe Ferrara; took notes regarding same	1.60	1.60
1864	02/25/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Ferrara; digested same	1.20	1.20
1866	02/25/15	NB	Reade deposition transcript of Hanlon; digested same	0.40	0.40
1150	02/25/15	JLN	Reviewed dep of 30 (b) (6) witness Valenti, highlighted same	0.60	0.60
1185	03/04/15	JLN	Started reviewed of Bernier's dep. highlighted and took notes re same	2.10	2.10
5115	03/07/15	MB	Prepare police expert Prof. Eterno deposition summary.	5.05	5.05
5116	03/08/15	MB	Prepare police expert Prof. Eterno's deposition summary.	7.05	7.05

	Date	Timekeeper	Journal Entry	Allocated Hours	Aggregate Hours
1205	03/08/15	JLN	Started review of Dr. Isakov's deposition; cross- referenced with his notes in the chart; made summary of salient points	2.90	2.90
5118	03/10/15	MB	Draft Prof. Eterno deposition summary.	5.92	5.92
5119	03/11/15	MB	Prepare Prof. Eterno deposition summary.	6.10	6.10
5120	03/12/15	MB	Prepare Prof. Eterno deposition summary.	4.83	4.83
1870	03/12/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of James; digested same	0.75	0.75
1872	03/18/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Lamstein; digested same	1.60	1.60
1873	03/20/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Lauterborn; digested same	2.10	2.10
1876	03/25/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Silverman; digested same	0.60	0.60
1886	04/08/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Lwin; digested same	1.60	1.60
1887	04/09/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Marino; digested same	1.80	1.80
1889	04/14/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Patel; digested same	1.10	1.10
1890	04/15/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Sangenti; digested same	0.60	0.60
1893	04/16/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of AS (Volume III); digested same	2.50	2.50
1892	04/16/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of AS (Volume II); digested same	2.90	2.90
1891	04/16/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of AS; digested same	3.10	3.10
1894	04/17/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of LS; digested same	1.40	1.40
1895	04/27/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Trainor; digested same	0.40	0.40
1896	04/27/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Valenti; digested same	1.10	1.10
1897	04/28/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Weiss; digested same	1.30	1.30
1898	05/01/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Broschart; digested same	2.10	2.10
1899	05/04/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Duncan; digested same	0.70	0.70

	Date	Timekeeper	Journal Entry	Allocated Hours	Aggregate Hours
1900	05/05/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Sawyer; digested same	0.80	0.80
1901	05/06/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Marquez; digested same	0.60	0.60
1902	05/13/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Purpi; digested same	0.75	0.75
1905	06/02/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Carrasco; digested same	0.90	0.90
1904	06/02/15	NB	Read deposition transcript of Milone; digested same	0.75	0.75
				415.97	