

EXHIBIT A

SUPPLEMENTAL BILLING NARRATIVES FOR SANCTIONS WORK

Date	Attorney	Relevant Billed Hours	Narrative
1/17/2012	O. Snyder	0.75	Attention to fee application.
1/17/2012	T. Dupree	2.25	Work on fee petition.
1/18/2012	T. Dupree	1.25	Telephone conference with O. Snyder, et al. regarding fee petition and strategy; memo regarding fees.
1/18/2012	A. Southwell	5.50	Review draft and edit fee application; review and edit declaration in support of fee application; discuss edits to brief and declaration with team; discuss few spreadsheet and narrative compilation with team; call with team re fee issues and strategy; electronic correspondence re same.
1/19/2012	T. Dupree	3.00	Revise attorneys' fees application; confer with A. Southwell re same; e-mail regarding edits and strategy.
1/19/2012	A. Southwell	7.00	Draft and edit fee application; discuss same with team; draft and edit Southwell declaration in support of fee application; review and edit narrative descriptions of services; review hourly totals; discuss totals with S. Narasimhan; discuss narrative descriptions with S. Narasimhan; discuss fee application with T. Dupree; discuss confidentiality and privilege issues related to fee application with team; electronic correspondence with team re fee application.
1/19/2012	M. Benjamin	7.50	Call with A. Southwell re fee application; call with A. Aycock re memorandum ISO fee application; revise Southwell declaration and exhibit ISO fee application; revise memorandum ISO fee application; research privilege of billing records and time entries under New York law.
1/19/2012	A. Aycock	8.50	Revise draft fee application brief; confer with local counsel re same; conduct follow-up research re legal standards re reasonable hours; confer with local counsel re same; review and revise fee application brief; confer with A. Southwell re same; confer with M. Benjamin re same; confer with local counsel re same and additional case law; prepare exhibits for A. Southwell declaration; review and revise draft fee application brief; confer with A. Southwell and S. Narasimhan re same; review summary of hours exhibit; edit same; discuss same with S. Narasimhan and A. Southwell.
1/20/2012	O. Snyder	1.50	Attention to fee application; discuss same with team.
1/20/2012	T. Dupree	1.00	Revise fee application; e-mail regarding same.
1/20/2012	A. Southwell	3.00	Review and edit fee application brief; review, edit and finalize declaration in support of fee application; electronic correspondence re fee application; final review of exhibits for declaration; discuss fee application with local counsel; discuss same with team.
1/20/2012	M. Benjamin	6.50	Revise memorandum ISO fee application and confer with A. Southwell, A. Aycock, and S. Narasimhan re same; revise Southwell declaration ISO fee application; confer with O. Snyder re memorandum ISO fee application; revise billing entries and confer with A. Southwell, A. Aycock and P. Narasimhan re same; revise memorandum ISO fee application; confer with T. Green re research ISO fee application; finalize and file fee application.

SUPPLEMENTAL BILLING NARRATIVES FOR SANCTIONS WORK

Date	Attorney	Relevant Billed Hours	Narrative
1/20/2012	A. Aycock	6.50	Review, revise, finalize, and file papers re fee application; confer with O. Snyder, A. Southwell, M. Benjamin, and S. Narasimhan re same.
1/30/2012	O. Snyder	0.25	Attention to Ceglia fee response.
1/30/2012	A. Southwell	0.50	Review fee opposition; electronic correspondence re same.
1/30/2012	M. Benjamin	0.50	Review Plaintiff's opposition to fee application and confer with A. Southwell and A. Aycock re same.
1/30/2012	A. Aycock	1.25	Review, summarize, and circulate internally Boland's response to Fee Application; correspondence with M. Benjamin re same.
1/31/2012	O. Snyder	0.50	Attention to fee motion.
1/31/2012	T. Dupree	0.25	Review Ceglia opposition brief; telephone conference with A. Southwell, et al. regarding same.
1/31/2012	A. Southwell	3.75	Review opposition to fee application; discuss fee application reply with team; review fee application; review and edit reply on fee application; discuss same with M. Benjamin; review cases on fee application issues.
1/31/2012	M. Benjamin	6.50	Meet with A. Southwell and A. Aycock re fee application opposition and reply and confer with T. Dupree re same; call with A. Aycock, S. Narasimhan, and J. Nonkes re fee application reply; research case law re preparation of time entries underlying fee application; draft reply memorandum ISO fee application; confer with S. Narasimhan re fee application research.
1/31/2012	A. Aycock	5.00	Review opposition to fee application; consider contemporaneous time sheet issue; review affidavits in W.D.N.Y. fee petitions re time sheet issue; compose analysis email to A. Southwell and M. Benjamin re same; confer with local counsel re same; review cases cited in Plaintiff's opposition; compose analysis email re same; confer with M. Benjamin, S. Narasimhan, and local counsel re reply to opposition to fee application; meet with A. Southwell and M. Benjamin re same.
2/1/2012	T. Dupree	0.25	Revise reply brief regarding fees; telephone conference with A. Southwell regarding same.
2/1/2012	A. Southwell	3.50	Review, draft, and edit reply on fee application; discuss reply with team; confer with T. Dupree re same; review and edit declaration in support of reply; discuss same with S. Narasimhan.
2/1/2012	M. Benjamin	5.50	Confer with A. Southwell and S. Narasimhan re reply memorandum ISO fee application and revise same; call with J. Nonkes re reply memorandum; call with A. Southwell re reply memorandum; call with S. Narasimhan re supplemental declaration ISO fee application; revise reply memorandum ISO fee application per client and T. Dupree edits; call with A. Southwell re reply memorandum; revise supplemental Southwell declaration; finalize and file reply memorandum ISO fee application; confer with team re same.
2/1/2012	A. Aycock	1.00	Review fee application reply brief; research case for reply brief; confer with M. Benjamin and S.

SUPPLEMENTAL BILLING NARRATIVES FOR SANCTIONS WORK

Date	Attorney	Relevant Billed Hours	Narrative
			Narasimhan re reply brief; research bankruptcy fee application for reply brief; confer with M. Benjamin re same.
	TOTAL HOURS:	83.00	