

EXHIBIT A

BILLING NARRATIVES FOR COMPEL WORK

Date	Attorney	One-Third of Half of Time Billed to 8th MTC	Narrative
8/23/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.67	Draft Eighth Motion to Compel.
8/26/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.42	Draft Eighth Motion to Compel.
8/28/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	1.00	Draft Eighth Motion to Compel; draft supporting declaration re same; confer with A. Aycock re same.
8/28/2012	Aycock, Amanda	0.17	Draft procedural history for Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with M. Benjamin re same.
8/29/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.50	Draft Eighth Motion to Compel; review and revise same.
8/30/2012	Dupree, Thomas	0.08	Review and revise Eighth Motion to Compel.
8/30/2012	Southwell, Alexander	0.17	Review and revise Eighth Motion to Compel; electronic correspondence re same.
8/30/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.50	Draft Eighth Motion to Compel; review and revise Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with A. Aycock re same.
8/30/2012	Aycock, Amanda	0.50	Review Eighth Motion to Compel for redaction; propose redactions; confer with M. Benjamin re same; review and revise redactions to Eighth Motion to Compel; draft Southwell Declaration in support of Eighth Motion to Compel.
9/4/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.08	Review and revise Eighth Motion to Compel.
9/5/2012	Dupree, Thomas	0.05	Review and revise Eighth Motion to Compel.
9/5/2012	Southwell, Alexander	0.25	Review and revise Eighth Motion to Compel; review and revise Southwell declaration in support of Eighth Motion to Compel.
9/5/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.25	Revise Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with A. Aycock regarding redactions to Eighth Motion to Compel; review and revise Southwell declaration in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; attention to filing.
9/5/2012	Aycock, Amanda	0.25	Review and revise Southwell Declaration in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; review and revise Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with M. Benjamin re same.
9/16/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.33	Outline Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel.

9/18/2012	Southwell, Alexander	0.17	Review and revise Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with M. Benjamin re same.
9/18/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.50	Draft Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with A. Southwell re same.
9/19/2012	Dupree, Thomas	0.13	Review and revise Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with team re same.
9/19/2012	Southwell, Alexander	0.08	Review and revise Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; electronic correspondence re same; confer with team re same.
9/19/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.10	Confer with team re Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; review client comments re Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with team re same.
9/20/2012	Southwell, Alexander	0.08	Electronic correspondence re Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; review and revise Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; review and revise supporting declaration to Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel.
9/20/2012	Benjamin, Matthew	0.08	Review and revise Southwell declaration in support of Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with A. Aycock re same; review redactions to Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel.
9/20/2012	Aycock, Amanda	0.67	Review and revise Reply in support of Eighth Motion to Compel; confer with M. Benjamin re same; review redactions of same; redact, finalize, and file same; prepare and send unredacted copies to Court and Boland re same.
TOTAL HOURS		7.03	