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IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF OHIO 

EASTERN DIVISION 
 
CITIZENS FOR COMMUNITY VALUES, INC., 
 
  Plaintiff, 
 
 vs. 
 
UPPER ARLINGTON PUBLIC LIBRARY 
BOARD OF TRUSTEES,  
 
  Defendant.  

: 
: 
: 
: 
: 
: 
: 
: 
: 
: 
 

 
 
 Case No. 2:08-cv-00223-GCS-NMK 
 
 Judge George C. Smith 
 Magistrate Judge Norah McCann King 
 

 

SUPPLEMENTAL ITEMIZED TIME STATEMENT OF TIMOTHY D. CHANDLER  

 

Date Task Hours Adjusted 
Hours 

Notes 

10/6/2008 Email exchange with opposing counsel and co-
counsel re. extension of time for Defendant to 
respond to fee motion. 

0.1 0.1 
 

 

10/16/2008 Email notification of Final Judgment and 
Permanent Injunction Order; reviewing same.  

0.2 0.2  

10/16/2008 Email exchange with Michele Schmidt re. 
preparation of bill of costs. 

0.1 0.0 3 

10/21/2008 Reviewing bill of costs (0.2) and email exchange 
with co-counsel re. same (0.1). 

0.3 0.3  

10/24/2008 Reviewing Defendant’s opposition to fee motion 
(0.3); email exchange with co-counsel re. filing a 
reply brief (0.1). 

0.4 0.4  

10/27/2008 Left voice mail with judge’s clerk about filing a 
reply (0.1); received call back from clerk stating 
we can file a reply and that there was not a set 
deadline for filing it (0.1); email to co-counsel 
re. same (0.1). 

0.3 0.0 3 

10/30/2008 Reviewing cases cited in Defendant’s opposition 
to fee motion and exhibits attached thereto (1.5); 
attempting to determine how defendant 
calculated total number of hours counsel spent 
on certain tasks (0.8).  

2.3 2.3  
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TOTAL HOURS (adjusted):  14.0 hours 

Notes re billing judgment:   

1) Reduced as duplicative or non-essential; billable time was sufficient to accomplish task. 
2) Non-billable work; not directly related to the litigation. 
3) Non-billable work; performing administrative tasks. 

10/30/2008 Outlining arguments, authorities to use for fee 
motion reply brief. 

1.3 1.3  

10/30/2008 Telephone conference with D. Langdon to 
discuss contents of fee motion reply brief.   

0.7 0.7  

10/30/2008 Researching whether fees can be awarded for 
unsuccessful settlement negotiations (0.5); 
drafting section of reply brief on same (0.6). 

1.1 1.1  

10/30/2008 Research (0.3) and drafting section on 
defendant’s other objections to individual time 
entries (vague entry, expert witness, paralegal 
work, etc.) (1.1). 

1.4 1.4  

11/4/2008 Drafting fee motion reply brief, sections on lack 
of special circumstances, level of success, 
conference time among counsel. 

3.4 3.4  

11/5/2008 Reviewing Faith Center documents and drafting 
fee motion reply brief, section on time spent on 
complaint and preliminary injunction documents.  

1.7 1.7  

11/5/2008 Drafting introduction and editing fee motion 
reply brief.  

2.8 0.5 1 

11/6/2008 Email exchange with co-counsel re. draft of fee 
motion reply brief.  

0.1 0.1  

11/7/2008 Email exchange with co-counsel re. argument in 
fee motion reply brief. 

0.1 0.1  

11/9/2008 Review Estep/Lambert pleadings for fee motion 
reply brief; draft email to co-counsel re. same. 

0.3 0.3  

11/12/2008 Email exchange with co-counsel re. finalizing 
fee motion reply brief; final review of all 
documents.  

0.5 0.1 1, 3 

TOTAL HOURS: 17.1 14.0  


