

Exhibit 9

Nelson Mullins

Nelson Mullins Riley & Scarborough LLP

Attorneys and Counselors at Law

Tax ID No. 57-0215445

Post Office Box 11070 / Columbia, South Carolina 29211

Tel: 803.799.2000

Cleveland Golf
ATTN: Stephen Gingrich
5601 Skylab Road
Huntington Beach, CA 92647

April 20, 2010
Invoice 993540 Page 1

Our Matter # 34230/01504
Name of Matter: Cleveland Golf v. copycatclubs.com

For Services Through 03/31/10

03/01/10 Draft and file expert witness disclosure; review and analyze deposition transcript of Mr. Prince; telephone conference with Attorney Finnerty concerning reminding defense counsel to produce documents, drafting motion to amend and drafting amended complaint.
J.C. MCELWAINE 2.20 hrs.

03/01/10 Phone conference with John McElwayne regarding litigation strategy; facilitate filing of expert disclosure.
M.T. NICKERSON 0.60 hrs.

03/02/10 Review and analyze deposition transcript for promises by Mr. Lizzi to produce documents; draft and incorporate revisions to letter to Mr. Lizzi concerning discovery issues and documents promised to be produced.
J.C. MCELWAINE 1.30 hrs.

03/09/10 Conference with Attorneys McElwayne and Patterson regarding case strategy.

C.S. FINNERTY

0.60 hrs.

03/09/10 Telephone conference with Attorney Finnerty, Attorney Patterson and Attorney Nickerson concerning strategy related to amendment of the complaint and scheduling order.
J.C. MCELWAINE 0.50 hrs.

03/09/10 Phone conference with Attorney McElwayne; draft proposed Amended Complaint adding Bright Builders.
M.T. NICKERSON 2.90 hrs.

2.30 hrs.

03/10/10 Telephone conference with Judge's law clerk concerning the judge's preference in amending the complaint with consent and expanding the scheduling order; draft email summarizing clerk's instructions to Attorney Finnerty.
J.C. MCELWAINE 0.40 hrs.

03/10/10 Draft First Amended Complaint; meet with Attorney Finnerty regarding same.
M.T. NICKERSON 0.70 hrs.

03/11/10 Draft and incorporate revisions to Amended Complaint; review and analyze Bright Builder's website and marketing materials; draft and incorporate revisions to Motion to Amend; review multiple websites hosted by Bright Builders for pattern of infringing behavior.
J.C. MCELWAINE 6.30 hrs.

03/16/10 Telephone conference with Attorney Finnerty and Attorney Nickerson concerning revisions to the First Amended Complaint concerning Shelley; draft and incorporate revisions to First Amended Complaint.
J.C. MCELWAINE 0.90 hrs.

[REDACTED]

03/19/10 Review Motion to Compel; review Motion for Amended Complaint; email attorney McElwayne regarding same.
M.T. NICKERSON 0.40 hrs.

03/23/10 Review and analyze filing notice for amended complaint, motion to amend scheduling order and amended scheduling order.
J.C. MCELWAINE 0.10 hrs.

[REDACTED]

0.50 hrs.

Fees for Legal Services..... \$13,410.00

BILLING SUMMARY

	<u>Hours</u>
J.S. PATTERSON	1.10
<u>J.C. MCELWAINE</u>	<u>14.50</u>
M.T. NICKERSON	5.20
TOTAL	<u>44.50</u>

CHARGES FOR OTHER SERVICES PROVIDED/EXPENSES INCURRED

03/02/2010 VENDOR: Teri L. Sampson d/b/a Carolina Reporting; INVOICE#: 10435-TS; DATE: 3/2/2010 - Court Reporter fee for Deposition of Christopher Prince 2/18/10. 574.85

Total Charges for Other Services Provided/Expenses Incurred..... \$614.10

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY

<u>Description</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
Court Reporters	<u>574.85</u>

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY

<u>Description</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
TOTAL	\$614.10

Net current billing for this invoice \$14,024.10

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE RECAP

<u>Original Invoice Number</u>	<u>Invoice Date</u>	<u>A/R Amt</u>
986095	03/05/2010	\$11,445.53
	A/R BALANCE	\$11,445.53

GRAND TOTAL **\$25,469.63**

Duplicate Copy