

Exhibit 20

Nelson Mullins

Nelson Mullins Riley & Scarborough LLP

Attorneys and Counselors at Law

Tax ID No. 57-0215445

Post Office Box 11070 / Columbia, South Carolina 29211

Tel: 803.799.2000

Cleveland Golf
ATTN: Stephen Gingrich
5601 Skylab Road
Huntington Beach, CA 92647

March 15, 2011
Invoice 1247485 Page 1

Our Matter # 34230/01504
Name of Matter: Cleveland Golf v. copycatclubs.com

For Services Through 02/28/11

01/31/11	Review opposing counsel's request regarding expert disclosure; analyze response and Gingrich testimony. J.S. PATTERSON	0.30 hrs.
02/01/11	Conference with Attorney Nickerson and McElwaine regarding trial preparation and tasks; prepare information regarding response to Court inquiry. J.S. PATTERSON	0.50 hrs.
02/01/11	Review and analyze evidence, deposition transcripts of M. Johnson, B. Cole and E. Davies and witness lists; Continue to draft and incorporate revisions to Rule 26(a)(3) disclosures; File and serve Rule 26(a)(3) disclosures. J.C. MCELWAINE	6.20 hrs.
02/01/11	Prepare Rule 26a3 disclosures; confer with Attorney McElwaine regarding same; phone conference with Attorneys McElwaine and Patterson regarding same; review documents for potential motion in limine. M.T. NICKERSON	1.30 hrs.
02/02/11	Review Response to Judge Order to be filed with Court; edit same and facilitate filing of same; review disclosures of Brightbuilders and analyse same for potential exclusion. M.T. NICKERSON	1.60 hrs.
02/03/11	Review documents for potential issues relating to motions in limine; Review and analyze Bright Builders' Rule 26(a)(3) disclosures and documents cited therein; Telephone conference with Attorney Patterson and Attorney Nickerson concerning trial preparation and motions in limine; Draft letter to Mr. Doolittle concerning late disclosure of expert witness. J.C. MCELWAINE	3.30 hrs.
02/03/11	Review newly produced documents; outline strategy to deal with newly disclosed expert; review information on new expert. J.S. PATTERSON	0.90 hrs.
02/03/11	Conference with Attorney McElwaine regarding trial strategy and motion in Limine; prepare disclosure for filing; conference with Attorney Patterson regarding trial strategy and preparation; review disclosure of expert rules in regards to expert disclosed by Doolittle; edit letter to Doolittle regarding same; conference with Attorney McElwaine regarding same. M.T. NICKERSON	2.40 hrs.

02/04/11	Draft and incorporate revisions to motion in limine; File motion in limine through PACER system. J.C. MCELWAINE	1.40 hrs.
02/04/11	Conference with Attorney Nickerson regarding motion in limine eliminating expert testimony. J.S. PATTERSON	0.20 hrs.
02/04/11	Draft Motion in Limine to exclude defendant's expert witness. M.T. NICKERSON	1.10 hrs.
02/07/11	Telephone conference with Mr. Doolittle concerning trial schedule and settlement possibility. J.C. MCELWAINE	0.40 hrs.
02/08/11	Develop witness preparation strategy; Review and analyze Bright Builders' Amended Rule 26(a)(3) pre-trial disclosures; Review documents cited therein and depositions for potential objections. J.C. MCELWAINE	1.40 hrs.
02/10/11	Organized use of paralegal on this matter and scope of work related to file management, exhibit organization and trial preparation; Review and analyze file and file materials in preparation for conferences with Paralegal Mathis and Attorney Finnerty; Draft notes concerning objections to witnesses and evidence and email to Attorney Nickerson; Begin draft of Pretrial Disclosures. J.C. MCELWAINE	3.40 hrs.
02/11/11	Research unpublished case law on statutory damages in South Carolina for trademark counterfeiting; Draft email forwarding case to Attorney Nickerson; Meeting with Paralegal Mathis to discuss trial preparation steps and focus. J.C. MCELWAINE	2.70 hrs.
02/13/11	Draft notice of withdrawal of motion in limine. J.C. MCELWAINE	0.30 hrs.
02/14/11	Review and analyze court order on sanctions. J.S. PATTERSON	0.20 hrs.
02/14/11	Conference with Attorney Nickerson regarding trial preparation and damage analysis. J.S. PATTERSON	0.20 hrs.
02/14/11	Draft objections to Bright Builders Rule 26a3 disclosures; phone conference with Attorney McElwaine regarding same; conference with Attorney Patterson regarding litigation strategy; phone conference with Steve Gingrich regarding trial preparation. M.T. NICKERSON	2.20 hrs.

02/15/11	Review and revise objections to Defendant's pre-trial disclosures. J.S. PATTERSON	0.40 hrs.
02/15/11	Review and analyze objections to Bright Builder's Rule 26(a)(3) disclosures; Draft and incorporate revisions to said disclosures. J.C. MCELWAINE	0.60 hrs.
02/15/11	Confer with Attorney Patterson regarding objections to Bright Builders 26a3 disclosures; edit same; finalize objections and facilitate filing of same with court. M.T. NICKERSON	0.70 hrs.
02/16/11	Review and analyze exhibits to verify that they correspond with proposed exhibit list in preparation for court ordered conference to mark and exchange exhibits with defendants; Review, draft respond to emails concerning exhibits. J.C. MCELWAINE	3.20 hrs.
02/16/11	Review potential exhibits; analyze damages presentation and documents needed to support claims. J.S. PATTERSON	1.70 hrs.
02/16/11	Prepare exhibits for trial; research damages available under Lanham Act; confer with Attorney Patterson regarding trial strategy; phone conference with Attorney McElwaine regarding exhibits. M.T. NICKERSON	1.80 hrs.
<hr/>		
02/17/11	Telephone conferences with Attorney Patterson and Attorney Nickerson to discuss exhibits; Review and analyze revised exhibits list. J.C. MCELWAINE	1.20 hrs.
02/17/11	Review proposed exhibits and narrow down to actual exhibits to be exchanged; conference with Attorney Nickerson regarding exhibit list. J.S. PATTERSON	1.60 hrs.
02/17/11	Prepare exhibits for trial; conference with Attorney Patterson regarding exhibits and trial strategy; conference with Attorneys Finnerty and McElwaine regarding trial strategy; review all exhibits and provide brief to Attorney Patterson regarding same; research jury instruction in 4th Circuit; begin drafting of pretrial brief. M.T. NICKERSON	3.70 hrs.

- 02/18/11 Prepare exhibits for trial; research joint and several liability for statutory damages case; begin drafting pretrial memorandum; research case law for same; phone all with Attorney McElwaine regarding exhibits conference; meet with Attorney Finnerty regarding same.
M.T. NICKERSON 3.30 hrs.
- 02/21/11 Telephone conference with Mr. Doolittle concerning pre-trial briefs; Telephone conference with Mr. Lizzi concerning pre-trial briefs.
J.C. MCELWAINE 0.20 hrs.
- 02/21/11 Draft email to Steve Gingrich regarding authenticate clubs needed at trial; draft emails to Attorney Patterson regarding authenticating exhibits at trial; draft Pretrial Memorandum; draft Proposed Jury Instructions.
M.T. NICKERSON 3.20 hrs.
- 02/22/11 Telephone conference with Attorney Nickerson concerning jury instructions and trial preparation; Review and analyze jury instructions; Draft and incorporate revisions to jury instructions; Draft jury voir dire.
J.C. MCELWAINE 3.80 hrs.
- 02/22/11 Draft proposed jury instructions; phone conferences with Attorney McElwaine and Patterson regarding admittance of exhibits and trial strategy; draft jury charges.
M.T. NICKERSON 2.20 hrs.
- 02/23/11 Prepare direct exam topics for S. Gingrich; telephone conference with S. Gingrich regarding direct examination and trial strategy.
J.S. PATTERSON 1.40 hrs.
- 02/23/11 Edit proposed jury instructions; edit voir dire questions; edit exhibit list; edit pretrial memorandum; prepare same for filing; phone call with Steve Gingrich; meet with Attorney Patterson regarding same; draft emails to Attorney McElwaine and Patterson regarding admittance of exhibits and trial strategy; research Fourth Circuit case law for jury charges..
M.T. NICKERSON 2.80 hrs.
- 02/24/11 Review and revise jury charges and pre-trial brief; conference with Attorney McElwaine regarding trial prep with Defendant Prince.
J.S. PATTERSON 1.40 hrs.

Total Charges for Other Services Provided/Expenses Incurred.....

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY

Description Dollars

TOTAL

Net current billing for this invoice **\$37,215.58**

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE RECAP

<u>Original Invoice Number</u>	<u>Invoice Date</u>	<u>A/R Amt</u>
1241483	02/22/2011	\$3,725.96
	A/R BALANCE	\$3,725.96

GRAND TOTAL \$40,941.54

REMITTANCE COPY

Please Return With Your Payment To:

ATTN: Accounts Receivable
Nelson Mullins Riley & Scarborough LLP
 Post Office Drawer 11009
 Columbia, South Carolina 29211
 Telephone (803) 799-2000
 accounts.receivable@nelsonmullins.com

Cleveland Golf
 ATTN: Stephen Gingrich
 5601 Skylab Road
 Huntington Beach, CA 92647

Our Matter # 34230/01504 For Services Through 02/28/11
 Name of Matter: Cleveland Golf v. copycatclubs.com

Fees for Professional Services	\$36,449.50
Charges for Other Services Provided/Expenses Incurred	
Net current billing for this invoice.....	\$37,215.58

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE RECAP

Invoice Number	Invoice Date	Invoice Amount	A/R Balance
1241483	02/22/2011	\$3,725.96	\$3,725.96

Total Accounts Receivable..... \$3,725.96

GRAND TOTAL \$40,941.54

Terms of Payment: Balance due within thirty days of invoice date

ELECTRONIC PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS

Domestic Wire Transfer
Receiving Bank:
 Columbus Bank & Trust (CB&T)
 1148 Broadway
 Columbus, GA 31901
ABA Number: 061100606
Beneficiary Customer:
 Nelson Mullins Riley &
 Scarborough LLP
 Operating Account
Beneficiary Account: 1002720611

Foreign Wire (USD) Transfer
Intermediary Bank:
 Standard Chartered Bank
 New York, NY
SWIFT Code: SCBLUS33
Beneficiary Bank:
 Synovus Bank
 Birmingham, AL
SWIFT Code: FICOUS44
Beneficiary Customer:
 Nelson Mullins Riley &
 Scarborough LLP
 Operating Account
Beneficiary Account: 1002720611

Automated Clearing House (ACH) Transfer
Beneficiary Bank:
 NBSC a division of Synovus Bank
 PO Box 1798
 Sumter, SC 29151-1798
ABA Number: 053200666
Beneficiary Customer:
 Nelson Mullins Riley &
 Scarborough LLP
 Operating Account
Beneficiary Account: 1002720611

Wire Reference Field: Note the NMRS Invoice and Matter Number