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Client# 34230 Cleveland Golf Billing Attorney C.S. Finnerty Date Printed 03/18/2011
File # 34230/01504 Cleveland Golf v. copycatclubs.com Prebill No. 1290157 Page 2

Fees Bill-Thru Date 03/17/2011

Cost Bili-Thru Date 03/17/2011

Date Acquired 07/09/2009

RE: 01504/ Cleveland Golf v. copycatclubs.com Matter Comments:

NBILLED TIME - Through 03/17/2011

Bas - Work Description TJoBili ToBill Spec Time ID No.
Doliars Phase / Task Codes Rate Hours Bil

Date Rate

Timekeeper / Base

J.S. Patterson . :
03/01/2011 . 2.80 395.00 1,106.00 Y Review juror questionnaires and finalize list of "for cause” strikes, 395.00 2.80 11631701
. work on pleading for cause strikes; continued analysis for positive
juror quallties; conference with Attorney McElwalne regarding
meeting schedule with Prince and preparation for his testimony.
M.T. Nickerson . ;
03/01/2011 170 250.00 425.00 Y Review two-hundred jury questionnaires received from Court; 250.00 1.70 11610813

organize same and review same for jury challenges for cause;
meet with Attorney Patterson regarding same; faciitate filing of for
cause objections; meet with Attorney Patterson and Finnerty
regarding liigation strategy; phone call with Steve Gingrich
regarding clubs; review order recelved from court.

J.C. McElwaine ;
' 03/02/2011 290 350.00 1,015.00 Y Telephone conferance with Attorney Patterson concerning jury *  350.00 2.90 11622569
- . charges, deposition designations and other trial preparations )
Issues; Revlew and analyze email from Mr. Doolittle concerning
discovery disputes; Develop list of assignment for trial preparation;
Review and analyze additional supplemental jury charges; Review
email correspondence among counsel for the parties conceming
objection to supplemental jury charges; Draft and Incorporate
revisions to subpoenas to Mr. Prince and Prince Distribution and
execute,
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. Fees Blll-Thru Date 03/17/2011 |

Cost Bill-Thru Date 03/17/2011

Date Acquired 07/09/2009

UNBILLED TIME - Throu /17/2011

Base Work Description i oBll| ToBlli Spec ﬂme ID No,

Timekeeper / Base Base
Date : Hours Rate Dollars Phase / Task Codes, . Rate Hours Bill :
J.S. Patterson j
03/02/2011 7.30  395.00 2,883.50 Y Review jury pool and analyze potential juror Information; telephone 306.00 6.20 . 11631622
: conference with opposing counsel regarding investigator’s report; .
review and revise final supplemental jury charges for Judge; travel
" #  to Columbia for-jury selection (half actual time).
M.T. Nickerson |
. 03/02/2011 - 2 480  250.00 1,225.00 Y Flnalize jury questionnaires received from Court for Attomey 250.00 4.90 11611287

Patterson; meet with Attorney Patterson regarding order received
from court; draft response to clerk regarding same; draft response
to opposing counsel regarding exhibits; draft Affidavit of Frederick
Fessenden; phone call with Attorney McElwaine regarding
proposed jury charges; draft supplemental proposed jury charges
per request of the Court; revlew cases cited by Defendant in
opposition to our jury charges; draft email to Attomey McElwaine
and Patterson regarding same.

J.C. McElwaine : T o - : ' @ &
03/03/2011 9.00 350.00 3,150.00 Y Travei from Charleston to Columbia and back; Preparation for and 350.00 7.20 1162257?
. selection of jury and assist with arguments of pre-trial motions;
Meet with Attorney Patterson and Paralegal Mathls conceming trial
preparation and jury selection. ,

J.S. Patterson
03/03/2011 6.90 395.00 272550 Y Pariicipate in Jury seiection and voir dire of jury pool; retum travel 395.00 6.90 11630330
: to Boston; develop outline of trial tasks for upcoming trial; begin to
v revlew G. Cole deposition for trial examination.

M.T. Nickerson |
03/03/2011 - - 220  250.00 550.00 Y Review depositions for Michael Johnson and Emily Davies in 250.00 2.20 11612385
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Ciient# 34230 Cleveland Golf Billing Attorney C.S. Finnerty
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Fees Blli-Thru Date 03/17/2011
Cost Blll-Thru Date 03/1772011
Date Acquired - 07/08/2009 [ .
UNBILLED TIME - Through 03/47/2011 |
Timekeeper / Base Base éase Work Description ToBlli oBll] Spec I D No
Date Hours Rate Dolla Phase/ Task Codes Rate ours Bill
preparation for trial; draft email to Attomey Patterson regarding j
same; prepare and send documents to Attorney Patterson needed :
for jury selection. )

J.C. McElwaine

03/04/2011 3.20 350.00
J.S. Patterson

03/04/2011 2.70 395.00
J.S. Patterson _ _
03/04/2011 0.60 395.00
M.T. Nickerson -
03/04/2011 . 4.10 250.00

1,120.00 Y Begin preparation for Price's direct examinatlon; review and
analyze exhibits and Prince’s_ deposition transcript.

1,066.50 Y

23700 Y

1,02500 Y

QO
&
o

Prepare for and participate in call with D. Reino regarding trial 395.00
strategy; review exhibits and work on trial presentation; analyze

Juror questionnaire responses for selected jurors.

Review and finalize affidavit for mystery buyer in lleu of testimony. 395.00

Meet with Attomey Paterson regarding trial strategy; facilitate 250.00
purchase of 588 wedge for use at trail; draft affidavit of Fessenden

to comply with Court Order; faciiltate execution of same; phone

conference with cllent regarding litigation strategy; confirm recelpt

of counterfeit clubs in South Carolina; research statutory damages

standard; review depasition designations of Bright Builders; meet

with Attomey Patterson regarding counter designations.

e
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|
3.20 116226061
2.70 | 11630084
060 - | 11631214
4.10 . 11613084
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Cost Bill-Thru Date 03/17/2011
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UNBILLED TIME - Thr 03/17/2
Timekeeper | Bage Base Base Work Description , ToBlll  ToBill 'Spec  Time D No,
Date ' Hours Rate Dollars Phasge / Task Codeg Rate  Hours Bill
= -l EED = g oan o L
J.C. McElwaine . .
03/05/2011 3.30 350.00 1,155.00 Y Draft Prince direct examination outllne.l g 350.00 3.30 11622662
J.C. McEiwalne X - .
03/06/2011 120  350.00 420.00 Y Revlew and analyze all trlal exhibits for potential use with Mr. 350.00 1.20 11622644
' Prince, Draft and mcorporate revisions to his direct examlnatlon
outilne.
J.S. Patterson . ’ ’
03/06/2011 8.90 395.00 2,725.50 Y Read depositions of G. Cole, B. Cole, and other Bright Builders * 395.00 6.90 11630763 _
- ’ employees to identify depo designatlons and to work on cross-
exam; travel to Columbia for trial; review designated testimony by
opposing counsel.
J.S. Patterson

03/062011 090 395.00 355,50 Y Conference with S. Gingrich regardlng overall trial themes apnd 395.00 - 0.90 11630964

strategy. . @ §)@

Y

J.S. Patterson )

03/07/12011 420 395.00 - 1,650.00 Y Work on opening statement and themes for trial; analyze legal 395.00 4.20 11630644
issues related to jury charge; discuss trial strategy with S. Gingrich
* and Attorney McElwaline; review important legal research to ensure
we cover elements in trial.
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i Fees Bill-Thru Date 03/17/2011
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UNBILLED TIME - Through 03/17/2011
Time er Base Base Base B Work Description IoB"! ToBI Spac Time ID No,
Date Hours Rate Dollars Phase / Task Codes Rate ours Bill :
J.S. Patterson , . : .
03/07/2011 5.80 395.0Q, 2,330.50 Y Meet with S. Gingrich and prepare for direct testimony; review . 395.00 5.90 11631775

potential exhibits; work on outilne for S. Gingrich; review counterfeit
clubs and ensure that S. Gingrich can explain Identifying
d\aracterlstlcg.

M.T. Nickerson '

03/07/2011 5680 250.00 1,400.00 Y Draft Proposed Verdict Form; draft Counter-designations of 250.00 5.60 11617873
deposition testimony; draft Objections to deposition testimony to be '
presented to Bright Builders; facliitate filing of same with clerk of
Court; research 4th Circuit case law on assessment of statutory
damages; conference with Attorney Patterson and Steve Gingrich
regarding litigation/trial strategy; conference with Attorney

. Patterson and McElwalne regarding statutory damages; research
- ownership structure of Auction Success Group in Utah; review
proposed verdict form sub,mitted by Bright Builders; review
objections to our jury instructions and deveiop legal argument

against same.
J.C. MtElwaine :
03/08/2011 1480 350.00 5,180.00 Y Continue to review and analyze cases in preparation for hearingon ~ 350.00 12.60 11623627

jury charges; Preparation for trial and participate in trial; Mesting
with Attorney Patterson and Mr. Gingrich to discuss trial strategy;
Prepare outline of themes of cross-examination of Mr. Cole and
closing argument. ’
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: Fees Bill-Thru Date 03/17/12011
Cost Blll-Thru Date 03/17/2011
Date Acquired 07/08/2009
UNBILLED TIME - Through 03/17/2011

Timekbeper | Base Base Base Work Description ToBill ToBii Spec  TimelID No.

J.S. Patterson :

03/08/2011 3.10  395.00 " 1,224.50 Finallze opening statement; finalize direct exam questions for 395.00 2.30 11631685
Prince and Gingrich; Identify and annotate exhibits for direct
examinations; conferences with S. Gingrich regarding trial.

J.S. Péﬁerson _

03/08/2011 890 395.00 3,5156.50 Participate in day one of trial and present opening statements; 395.00 8.80 11631687
direct examinations; and opposition to directed verdict.

J.S. Patterson : -

03/08/2011 210  395.00 829.50 Telephone conference with D. Reino regarding strategy for closing 395.00 2.10 11631691
statement and request for damages; analyze grounds for directed
verdict agalnst Prince; prepare arguments for directed verdict,

M.T. Nickerson ' | .

03/08/2011 080 250.00 225.00 Research standard in 4th Clrcult for directed verdict; draft 250.00 0.0 11620225 -
memorandum of law related to same; draft email to Attorney
Patterson regarding directed verdict strategy

J.C. McElwalne

03/09&011 8.70- 350.00 339500 Y Trial preparauon and parﬂdpate In trial of case. Work and oral 350.00 9.70 11623629
argument In support of jury charges. '

J.S. Patterson .

03/09/2011 10.70  385.00 4,226.50 Rrepare for and participate In day two of trial including cross-exam . 395.00 .  10.70 11631601
of defendant Bright Builders, evidentiary arguments, directed
verdict motion, and closing statement.

J.S. Patterson : ' ) "

03/00/2011 2.80 395.00 1,106.00 Finalize cross-exam outline and exhibits for cross-exam of G. Cole; 395.00 2.80 11631865
review and revise closing argument; conferences with S. Gingrich
regarding trial strategy.

M.T. Nickerson _

03/09[201 1 0.40  250.00 100.00 Draft Stipulation regarding trademarks to by used at trail; facilitate ~250.00 0.40 11618699

getting filing to Federal Courthouse
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; Fees BilkThru Date 03/17/2011
Cost Blll-Thru Date 03/17/2011
Date Acquired 07/09/2009

UNBILLED TIME - Through 03/17/2011

Base Base ase ’ Work Description ToBill oBlll Spec Time 1D No.
Hours Rate Dollars Phase / Task Codes Rate Hours Bill

- o -—.G—{gﬁi ay &y o
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J.S. Patterson

'03/10/2011 6.40 . 395.00 2,5628.00 Y Conference with Court regarding final jury charge; participate in 395.00 6.40 11630348
' : final day of trlal; discuss verdict with opposing counsel-for Prince .
and Bright Builders; analyze issues for entry of final judgment.
J.C. McEiwaine :
03/10/2011 8.90 350.00 3,115.00 Y Finish trial of case; Post-trial strategy telephone conferences with 350.00 6.40 11622966

trlal team and cllent; travel from Columbla fo Charleston.

11622365

aaas B9
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J.S. Patterson . 4
03N 1/2011 490  395.00 1,93550 Y Telephone conference with J. McElwalne regarding verdict form’ 395.00 4.90 11630917
! and entry of judgment; email S, Gingrich regarding verdict form;
Identify research needed prior to requesting judgment; retumn travel
to Boston.

- -’“ — e
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. Fees Bill-Thru Date 03/17/2011 .
Cost Blll-Thru Date 03/1722011
L Date Acquired 07/09/2009
UNBILLED TIME - Through 03/17/2011
Timekeeper | Base  Base "Base Work Description - ToBHI oBjll Spec  Time D No,
Date . Hours Rate Dollars Phase / Task Codes Rate Hours Bill S

to be multiplied before entry of judgment; research case law .

regarding whether attomeys' fees need to be added before s
judgment; draft press release; phone conference with cllent . : o
regarding press release; phone call to clerk regarding need.for )

motion of entry of defauit; meet with Attomey Finnerty regarding

press release and strategy for same. : &

-- '--m'ﬁ'w - —
G e q_ Gt e 11630625

~ d GEpe) (W) 11631732

= TR e
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Total Hours 231.00 Total ToBill Hours 222.60
Total Dollar Value $72,009.50 Total Dollar Value of ToBill Hours . * $68,984.00




Client # 34230 Cleveland Golf Billing Attorney C.S. Finnerty Date Printed  03/18/2011
File # 34230/ 01504 Cleveland Golf v. copycatclubs.com Prebill No. 1290157 . Page 10
Fees Blll-Thru Date 03/17/2011
Cost Bill-Thru Date 03M17/2011
Date Acquired 07/09/2009
EKE R SU RY
g Last Date '
Summary - Basa Time Summary - ToBIiil Time Atty Turned Optional Billing
Inltials ame Hours  Avg Rate Dollars | Hours _ Avg Rate Dollars In Time Crodit Credit
o GO ol T oS o
JCM J.C. McElwalne 66.20 350.00 23,170.00 59.70 350.00 20,895.00  03/10/2011
JXP J.S. Patterson 86.10 395.00 34,009.50 84.20 395.00 33,258.00 03/15/2011
o s ol O L
MTN M.T. Nickerson 28.60 250.00 7.150.00 28.60 250.00 7.150.00 03/16/2011
- o» 313\!@; o - p—gp———
Prebill Totals 231.00 311.73 72,009.50 222.60 309.90 68,984.00 Total Fees to Bill
D C S. 17/20 -
Cost Cost Description Cost ToBill Amt Cost ID No.
Code
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Faes Bill-Thru Date 03/17/2011

Cost Bill-Thru Date 03/17/2011

Date Acquired 07/08/2008

_ Total Costs
COST SUMMARY

ToBill Amt

Total Costs

TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES DUE - $69,675.20 .




