

Attachment One

Date	Activity	Attorney/ Paralegal	Time	Rate	Total
8/3/2010	Research traffic pumping actions in federal court; pull complaints on same	Swenson, Brooke C.	3.0	\$175	\$525
8/5/2010	Draft federal complaint	Knudson, Scott G.	2.0	\$415	\$830
8/6/2010	Draft complaint	Knudson, Scott G.	0.5	\$415	\$207.5
8/7/2010	Draft complaint for federal action	Knudson, Scott G.	4.00	\$415	\$1660
8/8/2010	Research and draft federal complaint	Knudson, Scott G.	3.50	\$415	\$1452.5
8/9/2010	Edit draft complaint	Knudson, Scott G.	2.50	\$415	\$1037.5
8/10/2010	Teleconference with B. Lawson regarding tariffs	Knudson, Scott G.	0.30	\$415	\$124.5
8/10/2010	Conference with P. Schenkenberg regarding tariffs	Knudson, Scott G.	0.30	\$415	\$124.5
8/10/2010	Review Quest and FOC petitions	Knudson, Scott G.	0.80	\$415	\$332
8/10/2010	Edit federal complaint, review NAT tariffs	Knudson, Scott G.	2.50	\$415	\$1037.5
8/11/2010	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Bret Lawson and Scott Knudsen regarding strategy for proceeding.	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	1.00	\$335	\$335

Attachment One

8/11/2010	Conference with B. Lawson, P. Schenkenberg regarding complaint(.8); review Quest petitions (.3); draft complaint	Knudson, Scott G.	2.6	\$415	\$1079
8/12/2010	Review and edit federal court complaint	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	0.30	\$335	\$100.5
8/12/2010	Edit complaint (2); draft correspondence to B. Lawson (.10; review tariffs)	Knudson, Scott G.	2.60	\$415	\$1079
8/13/2010	Research and revise federal complaint	Knudson, Scott G.	2.80	\$415	\$1162
8/13/2010	Review and edit federal complaint	Swenson, Brooke C.	0.60	\$175	\$105
8/14/2010	Teleconference with T. Tobin	Knudson, Scott G.	1.20	\$415	\$498
8/14/2010	Edit complaint	Knudson, Scott G.	1.30	\$415	\$539.5
8/15/2010	Edit complaint	Knudson, Scott G.	1.00	\$415	\$415
8/15/2010	Proof read and revise complaint for filing	Swenson, Brooke C.	1.00	\$175	\$175
8/16/2010	Edit complaint (1.5); revise per K. Ford comment (.1); teleconference with C. Cerry (.2); Teleconference with K. Ford (.3); review documents (.2);	Knudson, Scott G.	2.40	\$415	\$996

Attachment One

	teleconference with K. Ford (.2); draft correspondence to client regarding jury trial (.2)				
8/17/2010	Edit pro hac motion	Knudson, Scott G.	0.20	\$415	\$83
8/17/2010	Review and respond to K. Ford correspondence	Knudson, Scott G.	0.20	\$415	\$83
1/25/2011	Begin preparing Amended Complaint	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	1.50	\$335	\$502.5
1/26/2011	Edit first Amended Complaint	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	1.50	\$335	\$502.5
2/2/2011	Work on Discovery responses	Knudson, Scott G.	0.30	\$415	\$124.5
2/7/2011	Draft discovery responses	Knudson, Scott G.	0.50	\$415	\$207.5
2/8/2011	Draft Discovery responses	Knudson, Scott G.	1.50	\$415	\$622.5
2/8/2011	Draft Rule 26(a) Disclosures	Swenson, Brooke C.	1.50	\$200	\$300
2/8/2011	Discuss Rule 26(a) disclosures with Scott Knudsen	Swenson, Brooke C.	0.50	\$200	\$100
2/8/2011	Research Rule 26(a) Disclosures	Swenson, Brooke C.	0.50	\$200	\$100
2/11/2011	Draft Rule 26(f) Report	Knudson, Scott G.	1.30	\$415	\$539.5
2/16/2011	Edit Rule 26(f) report	Knudson, Scott G.	0.40	\$415	\$166
2/21/2011	Edit discovery responses	Knudson, Scott G.	2.50	\$415	\$1037.5
2/22/2011	Edit discovery	Knudson, Scott G.	2.00	\$415	\$830

Attachment One

2/23/2011	Revise discovery responses	Knudson, Scott G.	1.50	\$415	\$622.5
2/23/2011	Review NAT's responses	Knudson, Scott G.	1.00	\$415	\$415
2/24/2011	Review NAT discovery	Knudson, Scott G.	2.00	\$415	\$830
2/24/2011	Review NAT discovery responses and document production	Swenson, Brooke C.	2.00	\$200	\$400
2/25/2011	Prepare for depositions (review documents)	Knudson, Scott G.	1.50	\$415	\$622.5
2/25/2011	Review discovery for free conference transfers	Swenson, Brooke C.	0.50	\$200	\$100
2/26/2011	Prepare for depositions	Knudson, Scott G.	1.30	\$415	\$539.5
2/26/2011	Edit discovery brief	Knudson, Scott G.	2.00	\$415	\$830
2/27/2011	Review NAT documents	Knudson, Scott G.	2.00	\$415	\$830
2/28/2011	Prepare for Reiman deposition	Knudson, Scott G.	1.5	\$415	\$622.5
2/28/2011	Prepare for Big Eagle deposition	Knudson, Scott G.	0.80	\$415	\$332
2/28/2011	Draft discovery supplement	Swenson, Brooke C.	1.00	\$200	\$200
3/01/2011	Prepare for Cestero deposition	Knudson, Scott G.	1.00	\$415	\$415
3/01/2011	Depose Cestero	Knudson, Scott G.	4.00	\$415	\$1660
3/10/2011	Review Reiman documents	Knudson, Scott G.	0.40	\$415	\$166
4/19/2011	Review NAT discovery responses	Knudson, Scott G.	0.80	\$415	\$332

Attachment One

4/21/2011	Prepare amended notice of deposition for Reiman	Wold, Elizabeth A.	0.30	\$160	\$48
4/21/2011	Prepare for Reiman deposition	Knudson, Scott G.	2.00	\$415	\$830
4/21/2011	Review deposition testimony of C. Cesteros	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.10	\$200	\$20
4/24/2011	Prepare for Reiman deposition	Knudson, Scott G.	3.00	\$415	\$1245
4/25/2011	Prep for Reiman deposition	Knudson, Scott G.	5.00	\$415	\$2075
8/7/2014	Review correspondence regarding discovery	Knudson, Scott G.	0.10	\$415	\$41.5
8/13/2014	Review discovery requests served on NAT	Knudson, Scott G.	0.20	\$415	\$83
10/5/2015	Research and review cases regarding attorney fee demand on count one	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	1.00	\$380	\$380
10/5/2015	Draft and edit motion, memorandum, and statement of facts for summary judgment on count one	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	3.20	\$380	\$1216
10/6/2015	Review and incorporate edits on motion for summary judgment	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	0.50	\$380	\$190

Attachment One

10/6/2015	Email client group regarding motion for summary judgment	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	0.10	\$380	\$38
10/6/2015	Review and revise Sprint's motion for summary judgment on Count One and supporting documents	Joseph, Claire V.J.	1.00	\$240	\$240
10/9/2015	Finalize and file motion for summary judgment on count one	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	0.50	\$380	\$190
10/9/2015	Review updated motion for summary judgment on count one and email regarding the same	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.20	\$240	\$48
10/23/2015	Review and revise Sprint's reply memorandum	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.50	\$240	\$120
10/26/2015	Review NAT reply brief	Knudson, Scott G.	0.20	\$415	\$83
11/2/2015	Review and revise reply brief and circulate to client team	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.30	\$240	\$72
11/3/2015	Review and revise reply brief and circulate update draft with redline to client team	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.30	\$240	\$72
11/6/2015	Final review of reply brief and	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.30	\$240	\$72

Attachment One

	coordinate service of same				
2/26/2016	Email to client group regarding order issued on motions	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	0.20	\$380	\$76
2/26/2016	Review order issued by Judge Schreier on pending motions	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	0.80	\$380	\$304
2/26/2016	Review order relating to motion for reconsideration, motion for summary judgment, and motions to compel	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.30	\$240	\$72
3/1/2016	Prepare materials for M. Felton to confirm facts in supplemental discovery response	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	1.40	\$380	\$532
3/1/2016	Legal research relating to applications for prejudgment interest and the interest rate and calculation methods that should be applied	Joseph, Claire V.J.	1.50	\$240	\$360
3/1/2016	Conference with P. Schenkenberg regarding discovery responses and calculation of prejudgment	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.10	\$240	\$24

Attachment One

3/2/2016	Review of court order and revisions to Felton affidavit relating to same	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.20	\$240	\$48
3/2/2016	Review historic treasury rates for prejudgment interest calculation	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.30	\$240	\$72
3/2/2016	Phone call with M. Felton and B. Lawson regarding prejudgment interest calculation	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.30	\$240	\$72
3/2/2016	Email with M. Felton and B. Lawson	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.10	\$240	\$24
3/3/2016	Revisions to Felton affidavit relating to prejudgment interest	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.20	\$240	\$48
3/3/2016	Emails with client team relating to prejudgment interest	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.10	\$240	\$24
3/3/2016	Review Arkansas case relating to prejudgment interest date of accrual	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.20	\$240	\$48
3/4/2016	Voicemails from T. Tobin relating to prejudgment interest filing; call with T. Tobin relating to same	Joseph, Claire V.J.	0.10	\$240	\$24

Attachment One

3/7/2016	Review materials in response to Felton voicemail	Schenkenberg, Philip R.	0.20	\$380	\$76
TOTAL			98.7		\$36,798