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Before Armstrong, Presiding Judge, and Tookey, Judge, 
and Shorr, Judge.

PER CURIAM

Reversed and remanded.
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	 PER CURIAM

	 Mother appeals from a judgment establishing depen-
dency jurisdiction over four of her children. The juvenile 
court appointed a guardian ad litem for mother, and, based 
on the admissions the guardian ad litem made on mother’s 
behalf, entered a judgment of jurisdiction over mother’s four 
children. DHS concedes that the juvenile court erred.

	 ORS 419B.231(4) provides:

	 “A court may not appoint a guardian ad litem for a par-
ent unless the court finds by a preponderance of the evi-
dence presented at the hearing that:

	 “(a)  Due to the parent’s mental or physical disability or 
impairment, the parent lacks substantial capacity either to 
understand the nature and consequences of the proceeding 
or to give direction and assistance to the parent’s attorney 
on decisions the parent must make in the proceeding; and

	 “(b)  The appointment of a guardian ad litem is neces-
sary to protect the parent’s rights in the proceeding during 
the period of the parent’s disability or impairment.”

	 DHS concedes that there is insufficient evidence in 
the record to support the juvenile court’s finding that mother 
lacked “substantial capacity either to understand the nature 
and consequences of the proceeding or to give direction and 
assistance to the parent’s attorney on decisions the parent 
must make in the proceeding.” Id. We agree and accept 
DHS’s concession. We also agree that, because the juvenile 
court erred in appointing a guardian ad litem for mother, the 
court also erred in entering a judgment of jurisdiction over 
the children based on the guardian ad litem’s admissions.

	 Reversed and remanded.
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